Bid B24-06 Band Equipment Tabsheet Ponce Music & Arts Jackson

ITEM Brand/ Model Unit Cost Each Unit Cost Each Unit Cost Each

PICCOLO Gemeinhardt Roy Seaman Storm No Bid $2,333.67 $1,100.00
PICCOLO Pearl Flutes PFP-165 Grenaditte $1,196.00 $1,279.72 $890.00
PICCOLO Yamaha - YPC-81 $2,922.00 $3,126.54 $2,915.00
PICCOLO Yamaha YPC-32 $694.00 $742.58 $695.00
PICCOLO Yamaha YPC-62 $1,774.00 $1,898.18 $1,770.00

OBOE Fox Renard Model 330 Oboe $4,005.00 $3,798.50 $3,785.00
OBOE Fox Reneard Model 333 Protege $3,388.00 $3,204.65 $3,200.00
OBOE Selmer Model 123FB $2,375.00 No Bid $2,600.00
OBOE Yamaha 441 Intermediate Grenadilla $3,584.00 $3,518.16 $3,575.00
OBOE Yamaha 841 $6,232.00 $6,668.24 $6,215.00
OBOE Yamaha YOB 241 Series Student $1,651.00 $1,766.57 $1,645.00

ENGLISH HORN Fox Renard Model 555 English Horn $6,450.00 $6,152.50 $6,095.00

ENGLISH HORN Fox Model 500 English Horn $8,283.00 $7,918.00 $7,825.00

BASSOON Fox 41 $6,245.00 $5,938.50 $5,900.00
BASSOON Fox Model IV $7,189.00 $6,848.00 $6,970.00
BASSOON Fox Renard Model 220 $9,355.00 $8,934.50 $8,840.00
BASSOON Fox Renard Model 240 $10,466.00 $10,004.50 $9,890.00
BASSOON Fox Renard Model 51 $5,966.00 $5,671.00 $5,640.00
BASSOON Schreiber Model S16 Intermediate $8,825.00 $8,892.77 $8,100.00
BASSOON Selmer Bassoon Model 14328 $4,680.00 $5,003.75 $4,570.00

|

|

Eb SOPRANO CLARINET Buffet Crampon R11 Eb w/ Silver Keys $2,335.00 $2,449.23 $2,150.00
Eb SOPRANO CLARINET Buffet Crampon R13 Professional Eb w/ Silver Keys $5,525.00 $5,791.91 $5,075.00
Eb SOPRANO CLARINET Yamaha YCL- 681 $3,771.00 $4,034.97 $3,760.00
| ewsorravocarmner [N
Bb SOPRANO CLARINET Backun Beta Bb Silver Keys $1,255.00 $1,208.57 $1,185.00
Bb SOPRANO CLARINET Buffet Crampon E12 Intermediate $1,399.00 $1,466.97 $1,285.00
Bb SOPRANO CLARINET Buffet Crampon Premium Student Bb Clarinet $545.00 $549.98 $485.00
Bb SOPRANO CLARINET Yamaha YCL-450NM $1,043.00 $906.72 $1,040.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Buffet Crampon 1180 $5,899.00 $6,185.67 $5,420.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Jupiter JBC1000N $1,765.00 $1,886.76 $1,740.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Selmer 1430LP $2,440.00 $2,607.44 $2,380.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Yamaha YCL-221 $2,070.00 $2,214.90 $2,065.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Yamaha YCL-621 Low Eb $7,509.00 $8,034.63 $7,490.00
Bb BASS CLARINET Yamaha YCL-622I1 Low C $8,542.00 $9,139.94 $8,520.00

EEb CONTRA ALTO CLARINET Leblanc Model 7181 $6,145.00 $6,572.67 $6,000.00

BBb CONTRA BASS CLARINET LeBlanc L7181 BBb Contra Bass Clarinet $6,145.00 $6,928.28 No Bid

BBb CONTRA BASS CLARINET LeBlanc L7182 BBb Contra Bass Clarinet $6,480.00 $6,928.28 $6,330.00

SOPRANO SAXOPHONE Jupiter JSS 1100 $1,785.00 $1,909.50 $1,760.00




SOPRANO SAXOPHONE Selmer SS280R $1,605.00 $1,717.21 $1,570.00
SOPRANO SAXOPHONE Yamaha YSS475 1 $2,129.00 $2,278.03 $2,125.00
SOPRANO SAXOPHONE Yamaha - YSS-875EX $4,189.00 $4,482.23 $4,450.00
ALTO SAXOPHONE Yamaha YSAS-26 $1,214.00 $1,039.18 $1,210.00
ALTO SAXOPHONE Yamaha YAS-26S $1,353.00 $1,447.71 $1,350.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Jupiter JTS 1100 $1,915.00 $2,045.93 $1,890.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Jupiter JTS-700A $1,185.00 $1,264.99 $1,165.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Selmer STS280R $1,870.00 $1,996.75 $1,825.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Yamaha - YTS 875EX $4,367.00 $4,672.69 $4,350.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Yamaha YTS-26 Standard $1,533.00 $1,230.23 $1,530.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Yamaha YTS-480 $2,304.00 $2,465.28 $2,300.00
TENOR SAXOPHONE Yamaha YTS-62I11 $2,832.00 $2,878.73 $2,825.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Eastman EBS640 Professional $4,095.00 $3,938.67 $2,415.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Jupiter JBS 1100 $4,250.00 $4,547.05 $4,195.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Selmer BS400 $3,970.00 $4,857.94 $3,880.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Yamaha YBS-480 $5,004.00 $5,354.28 $4,990.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Yamaha YBS-52 $5,004.00 $5,354.28 No Bid
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Yamaha YBS-62 Il $9,449.00 $8,668.07 $8,080.00
BARITONE SAXOPHONE Yanagisawa BW01 $6,055.00 $7,765.91 $7,095.00
PICCOLO TRUMPET
PiccoL0 TRUMPET Schike .4
TRUMPET
TRUMPET Bach 18037 - Brass $2,525.00 $2,698.79 $2,465.00
TRUMPET Bach 180537 - Silver $2,525.00 $2,698.79 $2,465.00
TRUMPET Bach TR500S Silver $705.00 $771.43 $545.00
TRUMPET Bach TR600 Brass $1,135.00 $594.13 $470.00
TRUMPET Eastman ETR420 $425.00 $407.09 $410.00
TRUMPET Eastman ETR520 - Gold Trim $745.00 $674.42 $700.00
TRUMPET Jupiter JTR700 - Brass $455.00 $485.22 $455.00
TRUMPET Jupiter JTR700S - Silver $550.00 $588.21 $550.00
TRUMPET Jupiter JTR 1110SQ - Silver $1,065.00 $1,136.43 $1,050.00
TRUMPET King 2055T Silver Flair - Saddle $1,315.00 $1,405.37 $1,285.00
TRUMPET King 2055T Silver Flair - Trigger $1,375.00 $1,470.75 $1,350.00
TRUMPET Yamaha - YTR-2330 Brass $674.00 $519.25 $675.00
TRUMPET Yamaha - YTR-2330 Silver $774.00 $828.18 $775.00
TRUMPET Yamaha YTR-8335II - Brass $2,262.00 $2,420.34 $2,250.00
TRUMPET Yamaha YTR-8335IIS Xeno $2,362.00 $2,400.97 $2,350.00
FLUGLEHORN
FLUGLEHORN Bach 183 Stradivarius Series BB 183 - Lacquer $2,515.00 $2,686.07 $2,450.00
FLUGLEHORN Bach 183S - Silver $2,515.00 $2,686.09 $2,450.00
FLUGLEHORN Eastman EFG512 - Lacquer $685.00 $654.31 $650.00
FLUGLEHORN Eastman EFG512 - Silver $805.00 $771.15 $760.00
FLUGLEHORN Jupiter JFH1100RQ - Brass $915.00 $977.26 $900.00
FLUGLEHORN Jupiter JFH1100RSQ - Silver $1,020.00 $1,090.95 $1,000.00
FLUGLEHORN Yamaha YFH-631G Series Bb $1,670.00 $1,786.90 $1,665.00
FLUGLEHORN Yamaha YFH-631GS - Silver $1,770.00 $1,893.90 $1,765.00
FLUGLEHORN Yamaha YFH-8310ZII - Brass $2,412.00 $2,580.84 $2,400.00
FLUGLEHORN Yamaha YFH-8310ZIIS - Silver $2,512.00 $2,687.84 $2,500.00
F HORN
F HORN Conn 6D $3,610.00 $3,861.98 $3,530.00




F HORN Conn CONNstellation 8D Series $4,605.00 $4,923.56 $4,450.00
F HORN Eastman EFH463 $1,745.00 $1,678.82 $1,650.00
F HORN Eastman EFH682 - Fixed Bell $2,525.00 $2,432.25 $2,400.00
F HORN Eastman EFH682 - Silver $2,525.00 $2,622.27 No Bid

F HORN Eastman EFH884 - Fixed Bell $3,305.00 $3,182.96 $3,120.00
F HORN Eastman EFHBRVO $2,550.00 $2,140.15 No Bid

F HORN Holton 379 $3,280.00 $3,509.26 $3,200.00
F HORN Holton H179 Farkas Series Fixed Bell $4,605.00 $4,923.56 $4,450.00
F HORN Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1100 - Fixed Bell $2,425.00 $2,591.63 $2,390.00
F HORN Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1110 - Fixed Bell $2,425.00 $2,591.63 $2,390.00
F HORN Yamaha YHR-567 - Fixed Bell $2,695.00 $2,883.65 $2,690.00
F HORN Yamaha YHR-668l! - Brass $4,216.00 $4,511.12 $4,200.00
F HORN Yamaha YHR-668NII $4,216.00 $4,511.12 $4,200.00
F HORN Yamaha YHR-671 - Fixed Bell $4,216.00 $4,511.12 $4,200.00

MELLOPHONE
MELLOPHONE Eastman EMP304 $835.00 $803.12 $790.00
MELLOPHONE Eastman EMP304S $1,075.00 $1,036.81 $1,020.00
MELLOPHONE Jupiter JIMP1101M $1,400.00 $1,497.47 $1,400.00
MELLOPHONE Jupiter IMP1101MS $1,700.00 $1,818.47 $1,680.00
MELLOPHONE Yamaha YMP 204 $1,450.00 $1,551.50 $1,450.00
MELLOPHONE Yamaha YMP 2045 $1,581.00 $1,691.67 $1,580.00
TROMBONE
TROMBONE Bach 36 $2,635.00 $2,814.71 $2,570.00
TROMBONE Bach TB200 Discontinued $537.44 $1,330.00
TROMBONE Bach TB200S Discontinued No Bid $1,520.00
TROMBONE Bach TB600 $530.00 $1,452.99 $520.00
TROMBONE Eastman ETB221 $425.00 $407.09 $410.00
TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1100 $830.00 $886.31 $820.00
TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1100S $1,000.00 $1,068.21 $985.00
TROMBONE Yamaha YSL-354 $674.00 $562.52 $675.00
TROMBONE Yamaha YSL 447G $1,204.00 $1,288.28 $1,200.00
TROMBONE Yamaha YSL-881 $2,097.00 $2,243.79 $2,090.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Bach 36B $3,090.00 $3,303.81 $3,020.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Bach TB200B Discontinued $1,452.99 $1,330.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Conn 52H $1,670.00 $1,782.53 $1,630.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Eastman ETB428G $890.00 $844.53 $830.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Eastman ETB438GS $985.00 $947.61 $930.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1100F $1,105.00 $1,181.90 $1,090.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1100FS $1,320.00 $1,409.28 $1,300.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Yamaha YSL-448G $1,526.00 $1,551.74 $1,520.00
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE Yamaha YSL-8820 $2,624.00 $2,667.30 $2,620.00
BASS TROMBONE
BASS TROMBONE Bach 50A $5,640.00 $6,030.38 $5,510.00
BASS TROMBONE Bach 50B2 $4,790.00 $5,123.64 $4,680.00
BASS TROMBONE Conn 110H $2,565.00 $2,742.45 $2,500.00
BASS TROMBONE Eastman ETB848 $2,290.00 $2,204.74 $2,165.00
BASS TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1180 $2,510.00 $2,682.58 $2,475.00
BASS TROMBONE Jupiter JTB1180R $2,765.00 $2,682.58 $2,725.00
BASS TROMBONE Yamaha YBL 830 $4,494.00 $4,441.57 $4,480.00
BASS TROMBONE Yamaha YBL-421G $2,441.00 $2,611.87 $2,435.00
EUPHONIUM
EUPHONIUM Eastman EEP 526 $3,075.00 $2,954.16 $2,900.00




EUPHONIUM Jupiter JEP1000 $1,640.00 $1,750.34 $1,615.00
EUPHONIUM Jupiter JEP1000S $1,980.00 $2,114.14 $1,950.00
EUPHONIUM King 2280 $2,695.00 $2,883.04 $2,630.00
EUPHONIUM King 2280SP $3,070.00 $3,282.82 $3,000.00
EUPHONIUM Yamaha YEP 6421l NEO $6,450.00 $6,901.50 $6,435.00
EUPHONIUM Yamaha YEP 642l $5,773.00 $6,177.11 $5,760.00
EUPHONIUM Yamaha YEP 642SII $6,010.00 $6,430.70 $5,995.00
EUPHONIUM Yamaha YEP-321 $2,096.00 $2,242.72 $2,090.00
EUPHONIUM Yamaha YEP-321S $2,356.00 $2,520.92 $2,350.00
MARCHING BARITONE
MARCHING BARITONE Eastman EM411 $1,090.00 $1,049.10 $1,030.00
MARCHING BARITONE Eastman EM411S $1,375.00 $1,317.22 $1,300.00
MARCHING BARITONE Jupiter JBR1101M $1,825.00 $1,952.22 $1,800.00
MARCHING BARITONE Jupiter JBR1101MS $2,125.00 $2,273.22 $2,100.00
MARCHING BARITONE King KMB 411/412 $1,725.00 $1,841.32 $1,680.00
MARCHING BARITONE King KMB 4115/412S $2,067.00 $2,211.22 $2,020.00
MARCHING BARITONE Yamaha YBH-301M $1,979.00 $2,117.53 $1,975.00
MARCHING BARITONE Yamaha YBH-301MS $2,188.00 $2,346.51 $2,190.00
TUBA

TUBA Eastman EB231 $2,400.00 $2,309.76 $2,265.00
TUBA Eastman EB231S $3,195.00 $3,074.74 $3,020.00
TUBA Eastman EB431 $4,350.00 $4,185.36 $4,110.00
TUBA Eastman EB431S $5,115.00 $4,922.92 $4,830.00
TUBA Eastman EB534 $4,595.00 $4,421.05 $4,340.00
TUBA Eastman EB534S $5,290.00 $5,089.87 $5,000.00
TUBA Eastman EB562 $4,725.00 $4,548.22 $4,465.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1010 $4,125.00 $4,410.63 $4,070.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1010S $5,100.00 $5,456.55 $5,035.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1110 $5,270.00 $5,638.45 $5,200.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1110S $6,335.00 $6,775.33 $6,250.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1140 $4,975.00 $5,320.13 $4,910.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU1140S $5,825.00 $6,229.63 $5,750.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU700 $2,680.00 $2,864.48 $2,650.00
TUBA Jupiter JTU700S $3,570.00 $3,819.45 $3,530.00
TUBA Miraphone 186-4U No Bid $8,187.75 No Bid

TUBA St. Petersburg 202 No Bid $4,300.76 No Bid

TUBA Yamaha YBB-106 $3,269.00 $3,497.83 $3,260.00
TUBA Yamaha YBB-321 $5,529.00 $5,916.03 $5,515.00
TUBA Yamaha YBB-321S $5,874.00 $6,285.18 $5,860.00
TUBA Yamaha YBB-621 $7,299.00 $7,809.93 $7,280.00
TUBA Yamaha YBB-641 $7,364.00 $7,879.48 $7,345.00

SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA

SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Conn 20KSBW $9,955.00 $10,649.59 $9,730.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Conn 20KSPW $9,955.00 $10,649.59 $9,730.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Conn 20KW $9,045.00 $9,675.88 $8,840.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Eastman EPH495 $4,420.00 $4,254.23 $4,175.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Jupiter JSP1100 $5,400.00 $5,777.47 $5,330.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA Jupiter JSP1100S $6,650.00 $7,114.97 $6,565.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA King 2350W $7,965.00 $8,520.58 $7,785.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA King 2350WSB $8,765.00 $9,373.97 $8,565.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA King 2350WSP $8,765.00 $9,373.97 $8,565.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA YBB-202MWC Silver $6,919.00 $7,403.33 $6,900.00
SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA YSH 411 $7,032.00 $7,052.37 $7,015.00




SOUSAPHONE / CONTRA

|VSH 411S

DOUBLE BASS

DOUBLE BASS

|Scherl and Roth SR57

CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS

$8,291.00

$1,610.00 $2,102.87 $1,570.00

$8,399.50

$8,270.00

CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS Yamaha 2.5 octave YG-1210 $1,048.00 $1,205.20 $1,045.00
CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS Adams F5 - D8 Table Glockenspiel $2,365.00 $2,580.60 $2,300.00
CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS Adams 3.3 Octave Artist Series Glockenspiel GAT33 Traveler frame $5,765.00 $6,458.40 $5,175.00
CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS Adams 3.3 Octave Artist Series Glockenspiel GAF33 Field Frame $5,765.00 $6,387.10 $5,630.00
CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS Malletech 2.6 Infinity Glock/Orchestra Bells No Bid $2,494.80 No Bid
MARIMBA
MARIMBA Adams 4.3 Concert Synthetic w Field Frame ADM-MCKF43 $5,160.00 $5,755.75 $11,635.00
MARIMBA Adams 4.6 Artist Series w Field Frame ADM-MAHF46 $17,145.00 $18,906.00 $16,735.00
MARIMBA Adams 5.0 Artist Series w/ Field Frame ADM-MAKF50 $17,725.00 $19,546.55 $17,300.00
MARIMBA Adams - 5.0 University Rosewood Marimba #MAHUS0 $19,160.00 $16,225.35 $18,700.00
MARIMBA Yamaha 4.3 Octave Acoustalon with multiframe I $5,430.00 $6,358.35 $5,415.00
MARIMBA Yamaha 4.5 Acoustalon Marimba on Multi Frame I $9,235.00 $10,733.53 $9,210.00
MARIMBA Majestic 5.0 Reflection Series Marima $14,330.00 $16,479.36 $14,145.00
VIBRAPHONE
VIBRAPHONE Adams 3 Octave with Field Frame ADM-VCSF30 $4,975.00 $5,575.95 $4,860.00
VIBRAPHONE Adams Alpha Vibes $8,390.00 $9,855.50 $8,200.00
VIBRAPHONE Adams Artist Classic Vibes Discontinued No Bid No Bid
VIBRAPHONE Majestic V1530 Quantum Field Vibraphone $4,275.00 $4,915.82 No Bid
VIBRAPHONE Yamaha YAM-YVRD2700GG Gold Vibe on Multi Frame Il $6,182.00 $7,197.85 $6,165.00
VIBRAPHONE Yamaha YV3710MC $7,140.00 $8,214.45 $7,045.00
VIBRAPHONE Yamaha YV-520 3-Octave $2,285.00 $2,622.58 $2,275.00
VIBRAPHONE Yamaha YVT-2700GC Intermediate Tough-Terrain Frame Discontinued $5,368.78 No Bid
XYLOPHONE
XYLOPHONE Adams Alpha Xylophone $6,040.00 $6,609.05 $5,900.00
XYLOPHONE Adams Concert Series Xylophone $4,640.00 $5,077.25 $4,530.00
XYLOPHONE Adams 3.5 octave Synthetic Bar Soloist Xylophone $2,280.00 $2,494.35 $2,225.00
XYLOPHONE Yamaha YX-500R $3,640.00 $4,269.95 $3,630.00
XYLOPHONE Musser M-50 $4,270.00 $5,200.96 $4,405.00
XYLOPHONE Majestic 4 Octave Rosewood $4,015.00 $4,614.23 $3,960.00
CHIMES
CHIMES Adams - 1.5 Octave Philharmonic 1.5" Chrome Plated Chimes $7,310.00 $8,206.40 $7,140.00
CHIMES Adams 1.5 Octave GEN2 Chimes $4,135.00 $8,941.25 $4,040.00
CHIMES Musser 1.5 Symphonic Chimes Brass $5,620.00 $6,835.61 $5,490.00
TIMPANI
TIMPANI Adams Copper Hammered Professional Gen Il (20/23/26/29/32) $20,270.00 $28,532.08 $19,800.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Grand Symphonic Series with Gauge (23/26/29/32) $14,915.00 $18,222.66 $14,575.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Professional Series Polished Copper Set of 2 (26/29) $7,050.00 $8,623.48 $6,900.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Professional Series Polished Copper Set of 4 (23/26/29/32) $13,530.00 $16,559.33 $13,220.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Professional Series Polished Copper Set of 5 (20/23/26/29/32) $16,565.00 $20,283.76 $16,190.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Standard Series Fiberglass Set with Gauge (23/26/29/32) $9,615.00 $11,866.33 $9,400.00
TIMPANI Ludwig Standard Series Polished Copper with Gauge (23/26/29/32) $12,645.00 $15,500.94 $13,360.00
TIMPANI Yamaha Intermediate Series Smooth Copper Set of 4 (23/26/29/32) $12,823.00 $15,168.50 $12,800.00
TIMPANI Yamaha Standard Series Set of 4 (23/26/29/32) $9,678.50 $11,552.33 $9,650.00
SNARE DRUM

SNARE DRUM Black Swamp BLA-MS6514MD No Bid $1,035.36 $905.00
SNARE DRUM Black Swamp Multisonic Concert Snare Drum Maple - 14x5 No Bid $959.04 $840.00
SNARE DRUM Majestic 14x6.6 Prophonic Walnut Snare Drum $785.00 $897.40 $770.00
SNARE DRUM Majestic Concert Black 14X6.5 $445.00 $511.06 $440.00
SNARE DRUM Majestic Opus One 14x44 Nickel Piccolo Snare $700.00 $800.41 $685.00




SNARE DRUM Pearl Philharmonic PHP1465 $708.00 $814.20 $695.00
SNARE DRUM Yamaha YAM-CSM1465A $455.00 $522.68 $460.00
SNARE DRUM Yamaha YAM-CSM1465A Duplicate $522.68 No Bid
CYMBALS
CYMBALS Dream 22” Bliss Ride $285.00 $196.14 No Bid
CYMBALS Dream Pang China $165.00 $133.12 No Bid
CYMBALS Zildjian 8" A Custom Splash Cymbal A20540 $140.00 $91.21 $95.00
CYMBALS Zildjian 8" A Splash Cymbal A0210 $118.00 $76.19 $80.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Constantinople Bounce Ride K1060 $655.00 $363.16 $385.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Constantinople HiHats K1070 $635.00 $432.54 $460.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Leftside Ride K0986 $425.00 $275.08 $280.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Zil Bel A20002 $175.00 $115.56 $120.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Zil Bel A20001 $138.00 $89.11 $95.00
CYMBALS Zildjian Tam-Tam PO502 $1,900.00 $1,350.13 $1,275.00
CYMBALS Zildjian K Custom Dark Cymbal Pack $1,180.00 $885.65 $845.00
BASS DRUM
BASS DRUM Adams ADM-ABDS4022 $3,237.00 $1,350.13 $3,160.00
BASS DRUM Pearl Concert Bass Drum w/ field suspended stand PBE3618F/C46 $1,810.00 $885.65 $1,770.00
CROTALES
CROTALES Yamaha YM-4900A $9,910.00 $11,391.33 $9,880.00
CROTALES Zildjan High Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0615 w/mounting bar $2,550.00 $1,828.16 $1,755.00
CROTALES Zildjan High Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0615 w/o mounting bar $2,400.00 $1,711.00 $1,615.00
CROTALES Zildjan Low Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0625 w/ mounting bar $2,550.00 $1,828.16 $1,755.00
CROTALES Zildjan Low Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0625 w/o mounting bar $2,400.00 $1,711.00 $1,615.00
TAMBOURINE
TAMBOURINE Black Swamp 2 7/8" Grenadillo Castanets No Bid $162.00 $150.00
TAMBOURINE Black Swamp 10" Double Row Tambourine - TC1 $170.00 $210.24 $190.00
TAMBOURINE Grover 10" Custom Dry Double Row Tambourine - Hybrid Silver $205.00 $194.40 No Bid
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Ludwig Element Evolution w/ 22" Bass $750.00 $826.79 $824.00
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Pear| Eliminator Chain Drive Bass Drum Pedal P2050C $250.00 $190.90 $196.00
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Pearl Export Standard 5 Piece Drum Set $899.00 $606.05 $724.00
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Pear| Roadshow 5 Piece $590.00 $501.40 $524.00
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Yamaha Drumset Hardware Pack HW680W $280.00 $218.87 $252.00
DRUMSET/ COMPONENTS Yamaha Stage Custom with 22 in Bass (Natural Wood) YAM-SBP2F50-XX $675.60 $598.94 $622.00
FIELD DRUM
FIELD DRUM Pearl Philharmonic Mahogany 16x16 PEA-PHX 1616210
CONCERT SNARE STAND
CONCERT SNARE STAND Pearl S-1030L Concert Snare Drum Stand $170.00 $190.90 $192.00
CONCERT SNARE STAND Pearl S-1030D Concert Snare Drum Stand $170.00 $146.05 $172.00
CONCERT SNARE STAND Yamaha SS745 Snare Stand $100.00 $98.33 $140.00
CONCERT TOM STAND
CONCERT TOM STAND Yamaha WS865A Grand Series double concert tom stand
CONCERT GONG STAND
CONCERT GONG STAND Adams Gong Stand 4-wheel field frame $690.00 $714.15 $675.00
CONCERT GONG STAND Weiss Gong Stand WU322B No Bid $160.80 No Bid
PRACTICE PADS
PRACTICE PADS Innovative Percussion CP1 Corps Practice Pad
SPEAKER
SPEAKER Yamaha CW218V 2x18" Passive Subwoofer, 1220W Discontinued $921.74 No Bid
SPEAKER Yamaha C215V Dual 15" 2-Passive Speaker, 1000W With Handles $750.27 $1,404.05 No Bid
AMPLIFIER
AMPLIFIER Peavey MAX 100 100W 1x10 Bass Combo Amp $235.00 $226.08 $220.00
AMPLIFIER Roland KC-2000 Keyboard Amplifier $465.00 $488.38 $400.00
AMPLIFIER Roland KC-990 Keyboard Amplifier $955.00 $1,049.57 $810.00
AMPLIFIER Yamaha PX10 2-Channel Power Amplifier, 2x1200W At 4 Ohm $769.33 $859.13 $820.00

PORTABLE PA SYSTEM




PORTABLE PA SYSTEM Mega Vox Anchor Audio 2 No Bid $1,152.00 No Bid
AUDIO EQUIPMENT
AUDIO EQUIPMENT TASCM US 16x08 Audio Interface No Bid $344.70 No Bid
AUDIO EQUIPMENT SHURE QLXD14 Combo System J52 $899.00 $1,102.80 No Bid
AUDIO EQUIPMENT SHURE SLXD14DDigital Wireless Receiver J52 $999.00 $1,078.80 No Bid
AUDIO EQUIPMENT SHURE UA874 Active Directional Antenna $315.00 $424.80 No Bid
DIGITAL PIANO/KEYBOARD
DIGITAL PIANO/KEYBOARD Roland RD-2000 Digital Stage Piano $1,945.00 $2,036.09 $1,650.00
DIGITAL PIANO/KEYBOARD M-Audio MK3 88 key midi controller No Bid $149.40 No Bid
DIGITAL PIANO/KEYBOARD On-Stage Platform Keyboard Stand No Bid $55.31 No Bid
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Snare (FFX1412 - #102 Finish) w/chrome hardware $1,025.00 $1,301.80 $1,225.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Tenors (PMTMS60234 - #102 Finish) $1,765.00 $1,813.55 $1,820.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Bass (PBDM1614/A) $695.00 $831.45 $700.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Bass (PBDM1814/A) $775.00 $855.60 $740.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Bass (PBDM2014/A) $850.00 $924.60 $790.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Bass (PBDM2414/A) $900.00 $998.20 $870.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Championship Maple Bass (PBDM2814/A) $1,015.00 $1,125.85 $970.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Snare Airframe Carrier $305.00 $349.60 $300.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Tenor Airframe Carrier $355.00 $404.80 $350.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Pearl Bass Drum Airframe Carrier $320.00 $364.55 $315.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Yamaha 14x12 SFZ Marching Snare Drum $865.00 $1,093.08 $655.00
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Yamaha Stadium Hardware Tenor Stand $186.50 $214.48 No Bid
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Yamaha Stadium Hardware Snare Stand $186.50 $214.48 No Bid
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Yamaha Randall MAY Snare Carrier $272.50 $234.03 No Bid
MARCHING BATTERY/ HARDWARE Yamaha Randall MAY Tenor Carrier $326.00 $247.25 No Bid
AUXILLARY EQUIPMENT/ HARDWARE
AUXILLARY EQUIPMENT/ HARDWARE |Yamaha CS655 Cymbal Boom Stand $58.90 $41.41 $50.00
AUXILLARY EQUIPMENT/ HARDWARE _|Gibraltar Pro Boom Stand $115.00 $84.14 No Bid

Notes

FCS awarded all three vendors by line item

32 Line Items Awarded
Highlighted Above

50 Line Items Awarded
Highlighted Above

216 Line Items Awarded
Highlighted Above




